University of the Philippines Mindanao - <
Mintal, Tugbok District, Davao City
Standard Form No. SF-GOOD 48

BAC RESOLUTION DECLARING SCRB AND RECOMMENDING AWARD OF CONTRACT
No. 2016-36

WHEREAS, after two biddings the University of the Philippines Mindanao, through its Bids and Awards
Committee posted the Notice for Negotiated Procurement of the Supply of Appliances, Server, and Office
Equipment with an approved budget of One Million Ninety Thousand Eight Hundred Eighty Nine & 88/100
Pesos Only (P1,090,889.88) in the PhilGEPS website, in the UP Mindanao website, and in a conspicuous
place in the premises of the University of the Philippines Mindanao continuously for seven (7) days;

- WHEREAS, as a result of such advertisements one bidder, Phifcopy Corporation, submtted its price
quotation and other requirements upon the deadline on 19 December 2016;

WHEREAS, upon preliminary checking of the required documents submitted by Philcopy Corporation
consisting of SEC Registration, Mayor's Permit, Audited Financial Statement, NFCC, Technical
Specifications, Bid Form and Certificate of PhilGEPS Registration, the said bid8er was found eligible for
bidding;

WHEREAS, upon opening of the financial proposal the bid price was read as follows:

Particulars Approved Budget Bid Amount of Philcopy
Corporation
Item 1: Full HD LED Smart Television 61,200.00 No bid
Item 2: Television, 48 inches 50,000.00 No bid
Item 3: LED Smart Television 20,000.00 No bid
Item 4: Upright Freezer 34,000.00 No bid
Item 5: Refrigerator 40,000.00 No bid
Item 6: Chest Freezer 50,000.00 No bid
Item 7: Refrigerator 15,890.00 No bid
Item 8: Glass Chiller 50,000.00 No bid
Item 9: Water Dispenser 26,800.00 No bid
Item 10: Wall Fan | 88,000.00 No bid
Item 11: Stand Fan | 99,999.90 No bid
Item 12: Vacuum Cleaner, heavy duty 100,000.00 No bid
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Item 13: Floor Polisher / 50,000.00 No bid
Item 14: Paper Shredder 25,000.00 No bid
Item 15: Facsimile Machine 15,000.00 No bid
Item 16: Laminating Machine 49,999.98 No bid
Item 17: Server for Research Repository 155,000.00 No bid
Item 18: Electronic Presentation Device 70,000.00 i No bid
Item 19: Photocopying Machines " 90,000.00 P82,879.20

TOTAL P1,090,889.88 P82f879.20

WHEREAS, upon thorough evaluation of the eligibility, technical and financial documents submitted by
Philcopy Corporation for Item 19-Photocopying Machines (2 units), it was found to be compliant and
responsive to the specifications;

NOW, THEREFORE, we, the members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby resolve to award the

contract for the supply of photocopying machines to Philcopy Corporation with a contract amount of
P82,879.20;

RESOLVED on 21 December 2016, 2F Administration Building, University of the Philippines Mindanao,
Mintal, Tugbok District, Davao City.

BAC Member

Prof. ANTONIO R. OBSIOMA
BAC Chair
Approved:

Prof. SYLm B. CONCEPCION

Chancellor

Note: Prof. E. Protacio and Ms E. Caalaman were absent..



