

**BAC RESOLUTION DECLARING LOWEST CALCULATED & RESPONSIVE BID
AND RECOMMENDING AWARD OF CONTRACT**

Resolution No. 25, s. of 2017

WHEREAS, the University of the Philippines Mindanao, through its Bids and Awards Committee (BAC), posted the Invitation to Bid for the bidding of the Supply and Installation of Partitions, Drone, Imaging Laser Scanner, Total Station, Sound System and Other Equipment with an approved budget of Five Million Five Hundred Forty Nine Thousand Sixteen Pesos only (P5,549,016.00), in the PhilGEPS website, in UP Mindanao website, and in a conspicuous place in the premises of UP Mindanao continuously for seven (7) days;

WHEREAS, as a result of such postings four (4) bidders purchased bid documents and submitted their bids on October 25, 2017, the deadline for submission of bids;

WHEREAS, upon opening and preliminary checking of the eligibility and technical requirements of the four bidders all of them were found to be eligible for bidding;

WHEREAS, upon opening of the financial envelope and reading of the bids of the four bidders, the following were their bids as read by the BAC, namely:

Lot No	Description	Approved Budget	GH Office Depot	RASA Surveying	NR Eustaquio	Gakken
1	Supply & Installation of Partitions	599,016.00	599,016.00	No bid	No bid	No bid
2	Drone	125,000.00	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
3	Levelling Instruments	40,000.00	No bid	No bid	37,000.00	No bid
4	Imaging Laser Scanner	4,000,000.00	No bid	3,950,000.00	3,187,000.00	No bid
5	Hand Lens	33,000.00	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
6	Total Station	350,000.00	No bid	300,000.00	337,000.00	No bid
7	Handheld Compass	35,000.00	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
8	Stadia and Ranging Rod	17,000.00	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
9	Sound System	350,000.00	No bid	No bid	No bid	264,777.77
	TOTAL	5,549,016.00				

WHEREAS, after thorough evaluation and post-qualification of the technical specifications and other documents submitted by the bidders, the following were the findings: