UNIVERSITY OF THE PHILIPPINES MINDANAO
Bids and Awards Committee for Goods

BAC Resolution No. 16 5. of 2023

DECLARING THE LOWEST CALCULATED AND RESPONSIVE BID (LCRB) AND
RECOMMENDING AWARD OF THE CONTRACT FOR LOTS 28 OF THE SUPPLY OF KITS,
REAGENTS, CONSUMABLES, COMMON LABORATORY, AND LABELING SUPPLIES OF THE
SARS-COV2 BIO-SURVEILLANCE PROJECT OF PGC MINDANAO (PBM 2023-10)

WHEREAS, the University of the Philippines Mindanao, through its Bids and Awards Comminee for Goods
{BAC), posted on the PhilGEPS website, on the UP Mindanao website, and in a conspicuous place within the
campus for at least seven (7) calendar days, the Invitation to Bid of the Supply of Kits, Reagents, Consumables, Commaon
Laboratory, and Labeling Supplies of the SARS-COV2 Bio-Surveillance Project of PGC (PBM 2023-10) consisting of
eleven (11) lots with total approved budget for the contract (ABC) in the amount of P7.321,400.00;

WHEREAS, as a result of such postings six (6) bidders purchased bid documents and submitted their bids upon the
deadline for submission on April 24, 2023 consisting of the following;

MNa. Name of Bidder Date'Time Submitted Manner of
Submission
|| Joelmar Trading April 21, 2023, 10.21 AM Manual
2| Diamed Enterprises April 21, 2023, 2:18 PM Manual
i Kinovett Scientific Solutions Apnl 22, 2023, 7:58 AM Electronic
4 Rainbud Scientific Trading Enterpnse Apnl 23, 2023, 10:49 AM Electronic
-] Krvpton Intemational Resources April 24, 2023 8:12 AM Electronic
6 | Golden Bat (Far East) Inc. April 20, 2023, 10-20 AM Electronic

WHEREAS, afier the preliminary checking of the eligibility and technical envelope requirements the BAC
declared all the sx (6) bidders to be eligible for bidding,

WHEREAS, upon opening and checking of the financial bids, the BAC read out the following bid amounts, to

wil:
Lot No. / | Jocimar Diamed | Kinovett | Rainbud Kryplon Golden Bat
Approved Budget | Trading | Enterprises | Scientific | Scientific | International |  (Far East)
for the Contract Solutions | Trading | Resources Ine.
I';;.Im:i.m 561,250.00 | No bid No bid 620,900.00 | T46.600.00 | No bid
:;.im_m N bid 43201000 | No bid No bid No bid No bid
:ﬂ.:mm No bid Nobid | Nobid 898,810.00 | No bid No bid
If;-a;,mm No bid 3,570,400.78 | No bid Nobid | Nobid No bid
| mjmm No bid 94.200.00 | 120,900.00 | No bid Na bid 140,000,00
Eu:nm Nobid | Nobid 8400000 | No bid No bid _ 35,000.00
E,Tum.m No bid Nobid | 41500000 | No bid No bid r No bid
| |




Lot 8 Mo bid Nao bid N bid o bid No bid | 26662500
| 270,000.00
| Lat® !
300,000,00 Nobid | Nobid No bid No hid No bid No bid
Lot 10
250,000.00 No bid Nobid | Nobid No bid Mo bid No bid
Lot 11 |
50000 00 | no bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid .

WHEREAS, after the prelimmary checking of the financial component requirements, the BAC declared the lowest
calculated bad for cach lot as mdicated m the following list, to wit:

ll Lot No. Name of Bidder - Lowest Calculated Bid | Bid Amount ]
B Lot | Joclmar Trading 361,250.00
Lot 2 Dhamed Enterpriscs 432,000.00
Lot 3 Rainbud Scientific Trading Enterprise BOB.Rl000
Lot 4 Diamed Enterprises 3,570,400.78
L5 Diamed Enterprises 94, 200,00
- Lot & Golden Bat (Far East) Inc. 35, 00000
Lot 7 - Kinovett Scientific Solutions 413,000.00
Lot 8 Golden Bat (Far East) Inc. 266,625.00

WHEREAS, after the thorough evaluation and post quahfication of the bid documents submitted by Jochmar
Trading, the Lowest Calculated Bid for Lot 1 ~ Alcohol, their bid was found to be non-compliant and non-
responsive to the technical specifications on the grounds that the offered Absolute Ethanol was not molecular
grade,

WHEREAS, when the TWG conducted post qualification on the second lowest bidder, Rainbud Scientific Trading
Enterprise, it was found that some parts of their bid need clarification since the link provided was not accessible
and there were no brochures antached to their bid:

WHEREAS, upon the post qualification and thorough evaluation of the bid documents submitted by the other
bidders for Lots 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, and E,ﬂ:cfulhuingmth:mﬁﬁndings,umﬂy:

|
Lot Ne. Name of Bidder - Lowest TWG Findings -l
Caleulated Bid
Lot 2- Other Molecular Biology
Consunmables Diamed Enterprises Compliant and Responsive Bid
Lot 3-Common Laboratory and Labeling | Rainbud  Scientific Trading
Supplies Enterpnse Compliant and Responsive Bid
| Lot J—Sd:;gu:n:;ing_!ih Dramed Enterprises Compliant and Responsive Bid
Lot 5- PCR Kit Diamed Enterprises Compliant and Responsive Bid




=) = ——

Golden Bat (Far East) Inc., Compliant and Responsive Bid

Kinovett Scientific Solutions Compliant and Responsive Bid

Lot 6- High Fidelity PCR Kit

| Lot 7- DNA Enrichment Kit
| Lot 8- Manual Total Nocleic Acid
| Extmction Kit

Golden Bat (Far East) Inc. Compliant and Respo sive Bid

NOW THEREFORE, we the members of the Bids and Awards Committee for Goods hereby RESOLVE as it is
herehy RESOLVED:

1} To declare the following bidders as Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bid (LCREB) for the lots indicated below,

namely:
| Lot No.-Description Lowest Calculated and Amount of Contract (PhP)
Responsive Bid |
| Lot 2- Other Molecular Biology Diamed Enterprises
Consumables 432.010.00
Lot 3-Common Labomtory and Labeling Rainbud Scientific Trading
Supplics Enterprise B BYR K10.00
Lot 4- Sequencing Kit | Diamed Enterpnises 3570400 78
Lot 5- PCR Kit Diamed Enterprises 44,200,00
|
| Lot 6- High Fidelity PCR Kit Golden Bat (Far East) Inc. 35,000.00
Lot 7- DNA Ennchmem Ki Kinovent Seientific Solutions 415,000,00
Lot 8- Mamuml Total Nocleie Acid
| Eximction Kit | Golden Bat (Far East) Inc. 266,625 00

2} To direct the TWG to continne the post qualification on Lot 1 — Alcobol and send a request for clarification (o the
ILCB, and

3] To recommend the foregoing for approval by the Chancellor.
RESOLVED on May 25, 2023, through online meeting via Zoom,

Ms. JO-AN A, GARCIA (absent)

Member Member

Z7 A

FROF. KAREN JOYCE G. CAYAMANDA {absent) FROF. ERWIN E. PROTACIO

Member Vice Chair
Approved:
-.:,.I:' iy
PROF, CLETO L. NANOLA JR. PROF. LYRE ANNI E. MURAO
Chair Chancellor d



