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UNIVERSITY OF THE PHILIPPINES MINDANAO
" Bids and Awards Committee for Goods

BAC Resolution No. 19 5. of 2023

DECLARING THE LOWEST CALCULATED AND RESPONSIVE RID (LCRB) AND
RECOMMENDING AWARD OF THE CONTRACT FOR LOT 1 - ALCOHOL OF THE SUPPLY OF
KITS, REAGENTS, CONSUMABLES, COMMON LABORATORY, AND LABELING SUPPLIES OF THE
SARS-COV2 BIO-SURVEILLANCE PROJECT OF PGC MINDANAO {(PBM 2023-10)

WHEREAS, the University of the Philippines Mindanao, through its Bids and Awards Committee for Goods
(BAC), posted on the PhilGEPS website, on the UP Mindanao website, and in a conspicuous place within the
campus for at keast seven (7) calendar days, the Invitation to Bid of the Supply of Kits, Reagents, Consumables, Comman
Laboratory, and Labeling Supplies of the SARS-COV2 Bio-Surveillance Project of PGC (PBM 2023-10) consisting of
eleven (1) lots with total approved budget for the contract (ABC) in the amount of P7.32 1 400 00

WHEREAS, as a result of such postings six (6) bidders purchased bid documents and submatted their bids upon the
deadline for submission on Apnl 24, 2023 and after preliminary checking all the six bidders were declared eligible
for bidding;;

WHEREAS, upon opening and checking of the financial bids, the BAC read out the following bid wnounts,

namely

| Lot No. / Joelmar | Diamed | Kinovett | Rainbud | Krypton | Golden Bat
Approved Budget | Trading | Enterprises | Scientific | Sclentific International |  (Far East)
for the Contract Solutions | Trading Resources Inc.
Lot 1
750,000.00 361,250.00 | No bid No bid 620,900.00 | 74660000 | Nobid
Lot 2
545 000,00 Mo bid 432.010.00 | Nobid F Mo bid o bad Mo bid
Lot 3 | i i
91190000 No bid No bid Mo bid R98.810.00 | No bid No bid
Lot4 |
| 3,595.50000 | Nobid 3,570.400.78 | No bid No bid Na bid No bid ,
Lot 5
140,000,00 No bid 0420000 | 120.900.00 | No bid No bid 14000000 |
Lot
| 84,000.00 Mo bid No bid 8400000 | No bid No bid 3500000
Lot 7
413000, 00 | Mo bid Mo bid 413,000,00 | MNo bid Mo bad Mo bid
| Lot 8 Mo bid No bud Mo bid Mo bid Mo bid 266,625, 00
270,000, () - —=
| Lant 9
| 300,000.00 | No bid No bid Mo bid Nobid | Nobid No bid
Lot 10 i
S50 (b Mo bid N bid Mo bad Mo bid Mo bid Mo bid |
| Lot 11 :
0, 000,00 No bid | Mo bid No bid No bid No bid Mo bid |




WHEREAS, after the thorough evaluation and post qualification of the bid documents of the bids submitted. the
BAC passed Resolution No. 16 on May 25, 2023 recommending the award of the contracts for Lots 2-8 1o the

lowest calculated and responsive bidders and also directing the TWG to continue with the post qualification on the
bid submitted by Rainbud Scientific Trading for Lot 1 - Aleohal:

WHEREAS on May 30, 2023 the TWG reported that the bid submitted by Rainbud Scientific Trading for Lot |
- Aleohol was found 10 be compliant and responsive to the requirements;

NOW THEREFORE, we the members of the Bids and Awards Committee for Goods hereby RESOLVE as i1 1=
hereby RESOLVED:

1} To declare Rainbud Scientific Trading as Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bid (LCRRB) for Lot 1-Alcohaol:
And recommend the said bidder for award of the contract in the amount of P20, MWL 00 and

2} Te recommend the foregoing for approval by the Chancellor,

RESOLVED on May 30, 2023, at the Consunji Room and through online meeting via Zoom.
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M;Em a/PROF. JON HE

Member Member
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PROF. u&fﬂ CAYAMANDA PROF. ERWIN E. PROTACIO
Vice Chair
Approved:
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PROF, CLETO L. NANOLA JR. PROK/ LYRE ANNI E. MURAO
Chair Chancellor



UNTVERSITY
OF THE Socorro Brenda <ssacuna@up.edu.ph>
PHILIPPINES

BAC Resolution 19 Recommending Award of Lot 1 - Kits, Reagents,
Consumables of PGC Mindanao

Cleto Nanola <cinanola@up.edu.ph> Thu, Jun 1, 2023 at 6:48 PM
To: Socormo Brenda <seacuna@up.edu.ph>
Cc: Erwin Protacio <eeprotacio@up.edu.ph>

Dear Maam Brenda,
| am endorsing this, | have affixed my signature.
VWarm regards,

Ting
[Cructnd taxt hiddan]



